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This study investigates the effect of two
pricing structures on customers’ purchased
decisions, i.e. the value-added service
package on condition of a fixed subscription
fee and a fixed price for the subscription
per year. To ensure consistency of pricing
over time, both pricing structures must be
revised every year. In this study, we
assume that the availability of alternative
services is high, the fixed subscription fee
for services is low, and customers face
various types of uncertainty. An empirical
framework for analyzing customer
responses is introduced. The results are
then compared to the findings of analogous
studies in two areas of literature. Most of
the results show that only price
differentiation increases customer demand
for subscription per year and the customer
loyalty to value-added services, whereas
the structured pricing does not. Thus, free
trials appear to be the optimal pricing
method for long-term contracts. If free trials
are not available, the structured pricing
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might be a reasonable alternative. This
research focuses on the role of supporting
decision-making in the purchase of vehicle
service parts by analyzing the influence of
different information and context factors.
The supporting factors are impact of
increasing cost, impact of increasing
income, behavior of substitute utility, and
cooperation of the decision-makers. The
main goal is to find out which information
and context factors support and determine
the purchase of vehicle service parts. The
relationship of the factors is analyzed in
order to support decision-making in the
purchase of vehicle service parts. The study
is based on a questionnaire. A total of 127
students participated in this study. The
results show that support for decision-
making in the purchase of vehicle service
parts depends on the impact of increasing
cost and impact of increasing income, the
behavior of substitute utility, and the
cooperation of decision-makers.
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the manual was designed to serve as a
reference source for all levels of opel astra
owners and users. regardless of whether it
is a car owner who is going to buy a new

car, or an enthusiast who wants to take his
car or truck to the service center, the

manual can help. the book also contains a
lot of useful information about opel astra

models, including: the history of the car, its
production history, many photos of different
models and their accessories, the prices of

different versions of the car, prices of
repairs, and warranty information. the

manual also contains a wealth of useful
information on the engine and the opel

astra itself, an opel astra repair manual. in
addition to general information on the

engine, opel astra books and manuals, this
guide contains in-depth information on the
engine, which is presented in 11 sections,
including: cylinder heads, valves, pistons,

                               4 / 6



 

the crankshaft, pistons, connecting rods,
camshaft, valve train, ignition system, and

accessories. the manual also contains a
wealth of useful information about the car

body and its components, including the
engine, suspension, opel astra body, rear
suspension, wheels, brakes, and electric

system, and contains a detailed description
of all body systems, the engine

compartment, the engine and the opel astra
body. this book can be bought as a book, on
cd, or in electronic format, you can visit the
site of opel astra and download the book.

the workbook contains comprehensive
information on many aspects of the car,
written in clear and simple language. in

addition, you can find information on opel
astra components, including opel astra

parts, opel astra wheels, chassis and tires,
wheels, brakes, electronic equipment, and

much more. 5ec8ef588b
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